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PART I

ITEM 1. BUSINESS

DISCLOSURE REGARDING FORWARD-LOOKING STATEMENTS

This Annual Report on Form 10-K contains forward-looking statements within the meaning of Section 27A of the
Securities Act of 1933, as amended (the “Securities Act”), and Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as
amended (the “Exchange Act”). Actual results, performance or achievements could differ materially from those
projected in the forward-looking statements as a result of a number of risks, uncertainties, and other factors. For a
discussion of important factors that could cause our results, performance, or achievements to differ materially from
any future results, performance, or achievements expressed or implied by our forward-looking statements, please refer
to Part I, Item 1A “Risk Factors” and Part II, Item 7 “Management’s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and
Results of Operations” below.

GENERAL

Commercial Metals Company ("CMC") together with its consolidated subsidiaries (collectively, the "Company,"
"we," "our" or "us") manufacture, recycle and market steel and metal products, related materials and services through
a network including steel mills, commonly referred to as "minimills," steel fabrication and processing facilities,
construction-related product warehouses, metal recycling facilities and marketing and distribution offices in the
United States and in strategic international markets.

We were incorporated in 1946 in the State of Delaware. Our predecessor company, a metals recycling business, has
existed since approximately 1915. We maintain our corporate office at 6565 North MacArthur Boulevard in Irving,
Texas, 75039, telephone number (214) 689-4300. Our fiscal year ends August 31, and any reference in this Form
10-K to any year refers to the fiscal year ended August 31 of that year unless otherwise noted.

Our Annual Report on Form 10-K, Quarterly Reports on Form 10-Q, Current Reports on Form 8-K and all
amendments to these reports will be made available free of charge through the Investor Relations section of our
website, http://www.cmc.com, as soon as reasonably practicable after such material is electronically filed with, or
furnished to, the Securities and Exchange Commission ("SEC"). The information contained on our website or
available by hyperlink from our website is not incorporated into this Annual Report on Form 10-K or other documents
we file with, or furnish to, the SEC.

We have five business segments operating across two geographic divisions. Our CMC Americas Division includes
three segments: Americas Recycling, Americas Mills and Americas Fabrication. Our CMC International Division
includes two segments: International Mill and International Marketing and Distribution. Financial information for the
last three fiscal years concerning our five business segments and the geographic areas of our operations is
incorporated herein by reference from Note 21, Business Segments to the consolidated financial statements, which are
contained in Part II, Item 8 of this Annual Report on Form 10-K.

CMC AMERICAS DIVISION OPERATIONS

AMERICAS RECYCLING

Our Americas Recycling segment processes scrap metals for use as a raw material by manufacturers of new metal
products. This segment operates 27 scrap metal processing facilities with 14 locations in Texas, five locations in
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Florida, two locations in Missouri and one location each in Georgia, Kansas, Louisiana, North Carolina, Oklahoma
and Tennessee.

We purchase ferrous and nonferrous metals, processed and unprocessed, from a variety of sources in a variety of
forms for our metal processing facilities. Sources of metal for processing include manufacturing and industrial plants,
metal fabrication plants, electric utilities, machine shops, factories, railroads, refineries, shipyards, ordinance depots,
demolition businesses, automobile salvage firms and wrecking firms. Collectively, small scrap metal collection firms
are a major supplier.

Our scrap metal processing facilities typically consist of an office and a warehouse building located on several acres
of land that we use for receiving, sorting, processing and storing metals. Our warehouse buildings are equipped with
specialized equipment for processing both ferrous and nonferrous metal. Several of our scrap metal processing
facilities use a small portion of their site or a nearby location to display and sell metal products that may be reused for
their original purpose without further processing. We equip our larger metal processing facilities with various
equipment, such as scales, shears, baling presses, briquetting machines, conveyors and magnetic separators, which
enable these facilities to efficiently process large volumes of scrap metals.

3
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One of our metal processing facilities has extensive equipment that segregates metallic content from large quantities
of insulated wire. To facilitate processing, shipping and receiving, we equip our ferrous metal processing facilities
with presses, shredders or hydraulic shears to prepare and compress scrap metal for easier handling. We use cranes to
handle scrap metals for processing and to load material for shipment. We primarily transport processed ferrous metal
to consumers by open gondola railcar; therefore many of our metal processing facilities have rail access. When water
access is available, we also transport processed ferrous metal via barge.

Americas Recycling operates four large shredding machines, two in Texas, one in Florida, and one in Oklahoma,
capable of pulverizing obsolete automobiles or other sources of scrap metal. We have three additional shredders, two
operated by our Americas Mills segment and one operated by our International Mill segment. With the exception of
precious metals, our scrap metal processing facilities recycle and process practically all types of metal.

We sell scrap metals to steel mills and foundries, aluminum sheet and ingot manufacturers, brass and bronze ingot
makers, copper refineries and mills, secondary lead smelters, specialty steel mills, high temperature alloy
manufacturers and other consumers. Ferrous metal is the primary raw material for electric arc furnaces, such as those
operated by our Americas Mills segment and other minimills. Some minimills periodically supplement purchases of
ferrous metal with direct reduced iron and pig iron for certain product lines. Our Irving, Texas office coordinates the
sale of substantially all scrap metals from our metal processing facilities to our customers. We negotiate export sales
through our global network of offices as well as through our Irving, Texas office.

We are not materially dependent on any single source for the scrap metal we purchase. One customer represented 12%
of our Americas Recycling segment's net sales in fiscal 2015, compared to 16% and 14% in fiscal 2014 and 2013,
respectively. Our recycling business competes with other scrap metal processors and primary nonferrous metal
producers, both in the U.S. and internationally, for sales of nonferrous materials. Consumers of nonferrous metals
frequently can utilize primary or "virgin" ingot processed by mining companies instead of nonferrous metals. The
prices of nonferrous metals are closely related to, but generally are less than, the prices of primary or "virgin" ingot.

This segment's level of exports during a period is dependent on the level of demand and supply in the various markets
we serve. Additionally, for certain commodities the primary markets are outside of the United States. We exported 6%
of our ferrous scrap tonnage and 22% of our nonferrous scrap tonnage during fiscal 2015. This compares to ferrous
scrap tonnage exports of 4% and nonferrous scrap tonnage exports of 24% during fiscal 2014. The increase in the
percentage of ferrous scrap tonnage exported was due to a change in customer mix of certain products in addition to
higher production from our expanded downstream sorting operations. The decrease in the percentage of nonferrous
scrap tonnage exported was due to declining export demand, primarily in China.

AMERICAS MILLS

Our Americas Mills segment includes our five steel mills, commonly referred to as "minimills," two scrap metal
shredders and ten scrap metal processing facilities that directly support the steel minimills; and a railroad salvage
operation.

Our five steel minimills, located in Alabama, Arizona, Arkansas, South Carolina and Texas, produce one or more of
steel reinforcing bar ("rebar"), angles, flats, rounds, small beams, fence post sections and other shapes. We utilize a
fleet of trucks that we own or lease as well as private haulers to transport finished products from the minimills to our
customers and to our steel fabrication facilities. To minimize the cost of our products, to the extent feasibly consistent
with market conditions and working capital demands, we prefer to operate all of our minimills at or near full capacity.
Market conditions such as increases in quantities of competing imported steel, production rates at U.S. competitors,
customer inventory levels or a decrease in non-residential construction activity may reduce demand for our products
and limit our ability to operate the minimills at full capacity. Through our operations and capital improvements, we
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strive to increase productivity and capacity at the minimills and to enhance our product mix. Because the steel mill
business is capital intensive, we make substantial capital expenditures on a regular basis to remain competitive with
other low cost producers. Over the past three fiscal years, we have spent approximately $136.2 million, or 45%, of our
total capital expenditures on projects within our Americas Mills segment.
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The following table compares the amount of steel melted, rolled and shipped by our five steel minimills in the past
three fiscal years:
(in short tons) 2015 2014 2013
Tons melted 2,553,000 2,627,000 2,407,000
Tons rolled 2,387,000 2,437,000 2,295,000
Tons shipped 2,687,000 2,773,000 2,561,000

Descriptions of minimill capacity, particularly rolling capacity, are highly dependent on the specific product mix
manufactured. Our minimills roll many different types and sizes of products in their range depending on market
conditions including pricing and demand. Our estimated annual capacity for finished goods of approximately 2.9
million short tons assumes a typical product mix and will vary with the products we actually produce.

Our Alabama, South Carolina and Texas minimills each consist of:

•a melt shop with an electric arc furnace;

•continuous casting equipment that shapes molten metal into billets;

•a reheating furnace that prepares billets for rolling;

•a rolling mill that forms products from heated billets;

•a mechanical cooling bed that receives hot products from the rolling mill;

•finishing facilities that cut, straighten, bundle and prepare products for shipping; and

•supporting facilities such as maintenance, warehouse and office areas.

Our Alabama minimill primarily manufactures products that are larger in size relative to products manufactured by
our other steel minimills. These larger size products include mid-size structural steel products such as equal and
unequal leg angles, channels and flats. This minimill does not produce rebar. Our Alabama minimill sells primarily to
service centers; however, it also sells to customers in the construction, manufacturing and fabricating industries. The
Alabama minimill primarily ships its products to customers located in the Southeast, Midwest and Northeastern
regions of the United States. The minimill also services customers in California, Nevada and Texas.

Our minimill in Arizona utilizes a "continuous continuous" design where metal flows uninterrupted from melting to
casting to rolling. It is more compact than existing, larger capacity steel minimills, and production is dedicated to a
limited product range. This minimill primarily produces rebar; however, it also manufactures fence post sections. Our
Arizona minimill sells primarily to customers in the construction and fabricating industries. It also sells to service
centers. The Arizona minimill ships its products to customers located in the Southwest region of the United States,
primarily Arizona and California as well as Colorado, Nevada and New Mexico. In addition to the minimill, we
operate a rebar fabrication facility located on the same site.

Our South Carolina minimill manufactures a full line of bar size products, primarily rebar. This minimill also
manufactures angles, channels, flats, rounds, squares, and fence post sections. Our South Carolina minimill sells
primarily to customers in the rebar fabrication industry; however, it also sells to service centers, manufacturers of
original equipment, and the agricultural industry. The South Carolina minimill ships its products to customers
primarily located in the Southeast and mid-Atlantic regions of the United States, which include the states from Florida
through southern New England. In addition to the minimill, we operate a recycling yard, a steel fence post plant, and
an alloy briquetting facility located on or near the same site.
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Our Texas minimill manufactures a full line of bar size products, including rebar, angles, rounds, channels, flats, and
special sections used primarily in building highways, reinforcing concrete structures and manufacturing. This minimill
sells primarily to the construction, energy and petrochemical industries; however, it also sells to service centers and
manufacturers of original equipment. The Texas minimill primarily ships its products to customers located in
Louisiana, Oklahoma and Texas. It also ships products to approximately 20 other states and Central America. In
addition to the minimill, we operate a rebar fabrication facility, a shredder and downstream sorting equipment located
on the same site.
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The primary raw material that our Alabama, Arizona, South Carolina and Texas minimills use is ferrous scrap metal.
This segment operates ten metal processing facilities with four located in South Carolina, four located in Texas, and
two located in Alabama, which directly support the minimills. This segment also includes two shredders. We believe
the supply of ferrous metal is adequate to meet our future needs, but it has historically been subject to significant price
fluctuations which have occurred more rapidly over the last several years. All four of these minimills consume large
amounts of electricity and natural gas. We have not had any significant curtailments, and we believe that energy
supplies are adequate. The supply and demand of regional and national energy and the extent of applicable regulatory
oversight of rates charged by providers affect the prices we pay for electricity and natural gas.

Our smaller Arkansas minimill does not have a melt shop or continuous casting equipment. The Arkansas minimill
manufacturing process begins with a reheating furnace capable of utilizing billets acquired either from our other
minimills or from unrelated suppliers or used rail, primarily salvaged from railroad abandonments. The remainder of
the manufacturing process utilizes a rolling mill, cooling bed, finishing equipment and support facilities similar to, but
on a smaller scale than, those at our other minimills. The Arkansas minimill primarily manufactures fence post stock,
small diameter rebar and bed frame angles with some flats, angles and squares. Our Arkansas minimill primarily sells
to customers in the construction and manufacturing industries. Since our Arkansas minimill does not have melting
facilities, the minimill depends on an adequate supply of competitively priced billets or used rail. The availability of
these raw materials fluctuates with the level of excess billet production by our minimills or that offered for sale by
steel producers and for rail, the pace of railroad abandonments, rail replacement by railroads, demand for used rail
from competing domestic and foreign rail rerolling mills.

One customer represented 10% of our Americas Mills segment's net sales in fiscal 2015. No single customer
represented 10% or more of our Americas Mills segment's net sales in fiscal 2014 and 2013. Due to the nature of
certain stock products we sell in the Americas Mills segment, we do not have a long lead time between receipt of an
order and the delivery of product. We generally fill orders for stock products from inventory or with products near
completion. As a result, we do not believe that backlog levels are a significant factor in the evaluation of these
operations. Backlog for our Americas Mills minimills at August 31, 2015 was approximately $222.8 million,
compared to $256.2 million at August 31, 2014.

On July 27, 2015, we announced a plan to build a new minimill in Durant, Oklahoma. This new minimill will mirror
the "continuous continuous" design of the existing minimill in Arizona. We believe that this addition to our portfolio
of highly efficient, customer focused and cost effective steel production facilities should allow us to better serve a
growing North Texas market as well as expand into markets in Arkansas, Kansas, Missouri, Nebraska and Oklahoma.
At this facility, we plan to produce low cost, high quality steel products, which we expect will complement our
existing manufacturing capability to better serve our customers. We believe that this new minimill will also
complement our existing recycling and fabrication footprint, enhancing our ability to further leverage our raw material
supply chain and optimize product mix within our existing operations. We expect the Oklahoma minimill to be
commissioned in the fall of 2017. The direct and indirect investment is expected to be in excess of approximately
$250 million. We expect that this investment will be funded from internally generated capital.

In the first quarter of 2014, we sold all of the outstanding capital stock of our wholly owned copper tube
manufacturing operation, Howell Metal Company ("Howell"), for $58.5 million, of which $3.2 million was held in
escrow as of August 31, 2015, subject to customary purchase price adjustments. During the second quarter of fiscal
2014, we made a $3.0 million working capital adjustment, which is included in our estimated pre-tax gain of $23.8
million. Howell was previously an operating segment included in the Americas Mills reporting segment. We have
included Howell in discontinued operations for all periods presented.

AMERICAS FABRICATION

Edgar Filing: COMMERCIAL METALS CO - Form 10-K

10



Our Americas Fabrication segment consists of our steel fabrication facilities that bend, weld, cut and fabricate steel,
primarily rebar; warehouses that sell or rent products for the installation of concrete; facilities that produce steel fence
posts; and facilities that heat-treat steel to strengthen and provide flexibility.

Steel Fabrication
Through our Americas Fabrication segment we operate 42 facilities that we consider to be engaged in the various
aspects of steel fabrication. Most of the facilities engage in general fabrication of reinforcing and structural steel, with
four facilities fabricating only steel fence posts. We obtain steel for these facilities from our own minimills and
directly from third-party steel vendors. In addition, we utilize our marketing and distribution business to purchase
steel from other steel manufacturers.

We conduct steel fabrication activities in 14 locations in Texas, four in California and South Carolina, two each in
Colorado, Florida, Illinois, Louisiana, North Carolina and Virginia, and one each in Arizona, Arkansas, Georgia,
Mississippi, Nevada, New Mexico, Tennessee and Utah.

6

Edgar Filing: COMMERCIAL METALS CO - Form 10-K

11



Fabricated steel products are used primarily in the construction of commercial and non-commercial buildings,
hospitals, convention centers, industrial plants, power plants, highways, bridges, arenas, stadiums, and dams.
Generally, we sell fabricated steel in response to a bid solicitation from a construction contractor or from a project
owner. Typically, the contractor or the owner of the project awards the job based on the competitive prices of the bids
and does not negotiate with the bidders individually.

We have a steel post manufacturing operation located at our Arkansas minimill. Additionally, at our Arkansas
minimill and our facilities in San Marcos, Texas, Brigham City, Utah, and Cayce, South Carolina, we fabricate fence
post stock into studded "T" metal fence posts.

Backlog in our steel fabrication operations was approximately $767.9 million at August 31, 2015, compared to
$759.7 million at August 31, 2014. We do not consider other backlogs in the Americas Fabrication segment to be
material.

Construction Services
Our Construction Services business unit sells and rents construction-related products and equipment to concrete
installers and other businesses in the construction industry. We have 18 locations in Texas, five in Louisiana and one
in Oklahoma where we store and sell these products, which, with the exception of a small portion of steel products,
are purchased from third-party suppliers.

Impact Metals

We provide heat-treated steel products through CMC Impact Metals. CMC Impact Metals is one of North America's
premier producers of high strength steel products. We operate facilities in Alabama and Pennsylvania, which
manufacture armor plate for military vehicles, high strength bar for the truck trailer industry and special bar quality
steel for the energy market. During the fourth quarter of fiscal 2015, we closed a facility in Youngstown, Ohio. CMC
Impact Metals works closely with our Alabama minimill, our distribution business and other steel mills that sell
specialized heat-treated steel for customer specific use.

No single customer accounted for 10% or more of our Americas Fabrication segment's net sales in fiscal 2015, 2014
and 2013.

CMC INTERNATIONAL DIVISION OPERATIONS

INTERNATIONAL MILL

Our International Mill segment is comprised of all mill, recycling and fabrication operations located in Poland. Our
subsidiary, CMC Poland Sp. z.o.o. ("CMCP"), owns a steel minimill and conducts its mill operations in Zawiercie,
Poland. Our Poland steel minimill operates equipment similar to the equipment operated by our U.S. steel minimills.
This segment's operations are conducted through: two rolling minimills that produce primarily rebar and high quality
merchant products; a specialty rod finishing mill; our scrap processing facilities; and four steel fabrication facilities
primarily for rebar and wire mesh.
Our Poland minimill operates a flexible rolling mill designed to allow efficient and flexible production of a range of
medium section merchant bar products. This rolling mill has a second finishing end designed to produce higher grade
wire rod. This rolling mill complements the facility's other rolling mill dedicated primarily to rebar production. Our
Poland minimill operation has annual rolling capacity of approximately 1.3 million short tons.
Our Poland minimill is a significant manufacturer of rebar, merchant bar and wire rod in Central Europe, selling
primarily to fabricators, manufacturers, distributors and construction companies. The majority of sales are to
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customers within Poland. However, the Poland minimill also exports to the Czech Republic, Germany, Hungary,
Slovakia and other countries. Ferrous metal, the principal raw material used by our Poland minimill, electricity,
natural gas and other necessary raw materials for the steel manufacturing process are generally readily available,
although they are subject to significant price fluctuations. A large capacity scrap metal shredding facility similar to the
largest shredder we operate in the United States is located at the Poland minimill.
Our international fabrication operations have expanded downstream captive uses for a portion of the rebar and wire
rod manufactured at the Poland minimill. We conduct rebar fabrication activities in Zawiercie, Żyrardów and Głogów
Małopolski, Poland. These three rebar fabrication facilities are similar to those operated by our U.S. fabrication
facilities and sell fabricated rebar to contractors for incorporation into construction projects. In addition to fabricated
rebar, these facilities sell fabricated mesh, assembled rebar cages and other rebar by-products.

Additionally, we operate a fabrication facility in Dąbrowa Górnicza, Poland that produces welded steel mesh, cold
rolled wire rod and cold rolled rebar. This operation enables our international fabrication operations to supplement
sales of fabricated rebar by
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also offering wire mesh to customers which include metals service centers and construction contractors. We maintain
a presence in the Polish fabrication market but we also sell to neighboring countries such as the Czech Republic,
Germany and Slovakia.

Backlog in our international fabrication operations was approximately $16.8 million at August 31, 2015 compared to
$30.4 million at August 31, 2014. Our Poland minimill generally fills orders for stock products from inventory or with
products near completion. As a result, we do not believe that backlog levels are a significant factor in the evaluation of
these operations. Backlog for our Poland minimill at August 31, 2015 was approximately $25.3 million compared to
$49.0 million at August 31, 2014. No single customer represented 10% or more of our International Mill segment's net
sales in fiscal 2015 and 2014. One customer represented 10% of our International Mill segment's net sales in fiscal
2013.

INTERNATIONAL MARKETING AND DISTRIBUTION

Our International Marketing and Distribution segment includes international operations for the sales, distribution and
processing of steel products, ferrous and nonferrous metals and other industrial products. Additionally, this segment
includes two of our marketing and distribution divisions headquartered in the United States, CMC Cometals and CMC
Cometals Steel, and a recycling facility in Singapore. We buy and sell primary and secondary metals, fabricated
metals, semi-finished, long and flat steel products and other industrial products. During the past year, our International
Marketing and Distribution facilities sold approximately 3.1 million short tons of steel products in addition to raw
materials. We market and distribute these products through our global network of offices and processing facilities.

We purchase steel products, industrial minerals, ores, metal concentrates and ferroalloys from producers in the U.S.
and international markets. We utilize long-term contracts, spot market purchases and trading transactions to purchase
materials. To obtain favorable long-term supply agreements, we occasionally offer assistance to producers by
arranging structured finance transactions to suit their objectives.

We sell our products to customers, primarily manufacturers, in the steel, nonferrous metals, metal fabrication,
chemical, refractory, construction and transportation industries. We sell directly to our customers through and with the
assistance of our offices in Irving, Texas; Fort Lee, New Jersey; Sydney and Melbourne, Australia; Singapore;
Bangkok, Thailand; Luxembourg; Kürten, Germany; Cardiff, United Kingdom; Temse, Belgium; Hong Kong;
Beijing, Guangzhou and Shanghai, China. We have representative offices in Moscow and Malaysia, and we have
agents located in significant international markets. Our network of offices shares information regarding the demand
for our materials, assists with negotiation and performance of contracts and other services for our customers and
identifies and maintains relationships with our sources of supply.

In most transactions, we act as a principal by taking title and ownership of the products. We are at times designated as
a marketing representative, sometimes exclusively, by product suppliers, and on occasion we act as a broker for these
products. We buy and sell these products in almost all major markets throughout the world where permitted by United
States companies.

As opposed to companies that trade commodity futures contracts and frequently do not take delivery, we market
physical products. As a result of sophisticated global communications, our customers and suppliers often have easy
access to quoted market prices, although such price quotes are not always indicative of actual transaction prices.
Therefore, to distinguish ourselves, we focus on value-added services for both sellers and buyers. Our services include
actual physical market pricing and trend information (in contrast to market information from more speculative metal
exchange futures), technical information and assistance, financing, transportation and shipping (including chartering
of vessels), storage, warehousing, just-in-time delivery, insurance, hedging and the ability to consolidate smaller
purchases and sales into larger, more cost efficient transactions. We perform these services in the normal course of
business, and these services are included in the transaction price as there is no separate revenue stream for each
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service. We limit exposure to price fluctuations by generally offsetting purchases with concurrent sales. We also enter
into foreign currency exchange contracts as economic hedges of sales and purchase commitments denominated in
currencies other than the U.S. dollar or the functional currency of our international subsidiaries. In general, we do not
enter into derivative contracts for speculative or trading purposes.

This segment also operates a recycling facility in Singapore. The facility is similar to those operated by our Americas
Recycling segment but on a smaller scale and is operated as part of the International Marketing and Distribution
segment due to its oversight by managers in this segment.

We believe we are one of the largest marketers of imported steel in Australia. Despite focused efforts and substantial
progress to stabilize and improve the results of the Australian distribution business, we determined that achieving
acceptable financial returns would take additional time and investment. In the first quarter of fiscal 2015, the
Company made the decision to exit its steel distribution business in Australia. On July 31, 2015, we completed the
sale of six locations that were a part of our Australian steel distribution business. In addition, during the fourth quarter
of fiscal 2015, we ceased all operations at three other locations that
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were part of our Australian steel distribution business. As of August 31, 2015, one location of the Australian steel
distribution business remained for sale and continued to be classified as held for sale. We have included the results of
the sale and the activity related to our Australian steel distribution businesses in discontinued operations in the
consolidated statement of earnings for all periods presented.

In fiscal 2014, we decided to exit our steel trading business headquartered in Zug, Switzerland. Severance and other
exit costs incurred by the Company in connection with this decision were immaterial.

During fiscal 2013, we completed the sale of our 11% ownership interest in Trinecke Zelezarny, a.s. ("Trinecke"), a
Czech Republic joint-stock company, for $29.0 million resulting in a pre-tax gain of $26.1 million.

For financial data on the above segments, see Note 21, Business Segments, to the consolidated financial statements in
this Annual Report on Form 10-K.

SEASONALITY

Many of our minimills and fabrication facilities serve customers in the construction industry. Due to the increase in
construction during the spring and summer months, our net sales are generally higher in the third and fourth quarters
than in the first and second quarters of our fiscal year.

COMPETITION

The nonferrous recycling industry is fragmented in the United States. However, we believe our Americas Recycling
segment is one of the largest entities engaged in the recycling of nonferrous metals in the United States. We are also a
major regional processor of ferrous metal. The metal processing business is subject to cyclical fluctuations based upon
the availability and price of unprocessed scrap metal and the demand for steel and nonferrous metals. In our Americas
Recycling segment, we compete primarily on price and on the services we provide to scrap suppliers and generators.
The price offered for scrap metal is the principle competitive factor in acquiring material from smaller scrap metals
collection firms. Industrial generators of scrap metal may also consider factors other than price, such as supplying
appropriate collection containers, timely removal, reliable documentation including accurate and detailed purchase
records with customized reports, the ability to service multiple locations, insurance coverage, and the buyer's financial
strength.

Our Americas Mills segment competes with regional, national and foreign manufacturers of steel. We produce a
significant percentage of the total domestic output of rebar and merchant bar. We do not produce a significant
percentage of the total U.S. output of our other products. However, we are considered a substantial supplier in the
geographic areas near our facilities. We compete primarily on the services we provide to our customers and on the
price and quality of our products. See "Risk Factors — Risks Related to Our Industry" below.

Our Americas Fabrication segment competes with regional and national suppliers. We believe that we are among the
largest fabricators of rebar in the United States. We also believe that we are the largest manufacturer of steel fence
posts in the United States. We compete primarily on price in addition to the value added services we provide to our
customers.  While price is the principle competitive factor, we also compete on speed of delivery, ability to service
large projects, and technical capability. 

Our International Mill segment competes with several large manufacturers of rebar and wire rod in Central and
Eastern Europe, primarily on the basis of price, quality and product availability. We also compete on delivery times
utilizing our global supply chain of steel producers and logistic partners. We believe we are the largest producer of
merchant bars and the second largest producer of rebar and wire rod in Poland.
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Our International Marketing and Distribution segment operates in a highly competitive sector. We compete primarily
on the price, quality and reliability of our products, our financing alternatives and the additional services we provide.
In this business, we compete with other U.S. and foreign trading companies, some of which are larger and may have
access to greater financial resources. In addition, some of our competitors may be able to pursue business without
restriction by the laws of the United States. We also compete with industrial consumers who purchase directly from
suppliers, and from importers and manufacturers of semi-finished ferrous and nonferrous metals. We believe G.A.M.,
our steel distribution facility in Australia, is one of the largest independent distributors of those products in Victoria,
Australia.

9
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ENVIRONMENTAL MATTERS

A significant factor in our business is our compliance with environmental laws and regulations. See Part I, Item 1A,
"Risk Factors — Risks Related to Our Industry" below. Compliance with and changes in various environmental
requirements and environmental risks applicable to our industry may adversely affect our results of operations and
financial condition.

Occasionally, we may be required to clean up or take certain remediation action with regard to sites we use or
formerly used in our operations. We may also be required to pay for a portion of the cleanup or remediation cost at
sites we never owned or at sites which we never operated, if we are found to have arranged for treatment or disposal
of hazardous substances on the sites. Under the Comprehensive Environmental Response, Compensation and Liability
Act ("CERCLA" or "Superfund") and analogous state statutes, we could be responsible for both the costs of cleanup
as well as for associated natural resource damages. The U.S. Environmental Protection Agency ("EPA"), or equivalent
state agency, has named us as a potentially responsible party ("PRP") at several federal Superfund sites or similar state
sites. In some cases, these agencies allege that we are one of many PRPs responsible for the cleanup of a site because
we sold scrap metals to or otherwise disposed of materials at the site. With respect to the sale of scrap metals, we
contend that an arm's length sale of valuable scrap metal for use as a raw material in a manufacturing process that we
do not control should not constitute "an arrangement for disposal or treatment of hazardous substances" as defined
under Federal law. In 2000, the Superfund Recycling Equity Act was signed into law which, subject to the satisfaction
of certain conditions, provides legitimate sellers of scrap metal for recycling with some relief from Superfund liability
under Federal law. Despite Congress' clarification of the intent of the Federal law, some state laws and environmental
agencies still seek to impose such liability. We believe efforts to impose such liability are contrary to public policy
objectives and legislation encouraging recycling and promoting the use of recycled materials, and we continue to
support clarification of state laws and regulations consistent with Congress' action.

New federal, state and local laws, regulations and the varying interpretations of such laws by regulatory agencies and
the judiciary impact how much money we spend on environmental compliance. In addition, uncertainty regarding
adequate control levels, testing and sampling procedures, new pollution control technology and cost benefit analysis
based on market conditions impact our future expenditures in order to comply with environmental requirements. We
cannot predict the total amount of capital expenditures or increases in operating costs or other expenses that may be
required as a result of environmental compliance. We also do not know if we can pass such costs on to our customers
through product price increases. During fiscal 2015, we incurred environmental costs including disposal, permits,
license fees, tests, studies, remediation, consultant fees and environmental personnel expense of approximately $31.7
million. In addition, during fiscal 2015, we estimate that we spent approximately $10.4 million on capital expenditures
for environmental projects. We believe that our facilities are in material compliance with currently applicable
environmental laws and regulations. We anticipate capital expenditures for new environmental control facilities
during fiscal 2016 to be approximately $28.2 million.

EMPLOYEES

As of August 31, 2015, the Company had the following number of employees:

Segment Number of
Employees

Americas Recycling 1,252
Americas Mills 1,793
Americas Fabrication 3,297
International Mill 1,811
International Marketing and Distribution 461
Corporate 512
Total 9,126
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Certain of our employees belong to unions for collective bargaining purposes, including (i) employees at one metal
processing facility and five fabrication facilities within the CMC Americas division and (ii) approximately 40% of the
employees in our International Mill segment. We believe that our labor relations are generally good to excellent and
that our work force is highly motivated.

EXECUTIVE OFFICERS OF THE REGISTRANT

Our Board of Directors typically elects officers at its first meeting after our annual meeting of stockholders. Our
executive officers continue to serve for terms set from time to time by our Board of Directors in its discretion. The
table below sets forth the name,
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current position and offices, age and period served for each of our executive officers.

EXECUTIVE
NAME CURRENT POSITION & OFFICES AGE OFFICER SINCE

Joseph Alvarado Chairman of the Board, President and Chief Executive
Officer 63 2010

Adam B. Batchelor Vice President of Strategy and Planning 34 2013
Carey J. Dubois Vice President and Treasurer 55 2012
John Elmore Senior Vice President and President of CMC International 57 2012
Terry Hatten Vice President and Chief Human Resources Officer 48 2013
Adam R. Hickey Vice President and Controller 40 2012
Paul K. Kirkpatrick Vice President, General Counsel and Corporate Secretary 44 2013

Tracy L. Porter Senior Vice President and President, CMC Americas
Division 58 2010

Barbara R. Smith Senior Vice President and Chief Financial Officer 56 2011

Joseph Alvarado was hired by the Company in April 2010, as Executive Vice President and Chief Operating Officer.
From 2004 to 2007, Mr. Alvarado served as President and Chief Operating Officer at Lone Star Technologies, Inc., a
Dallas, Texas-based company and manufacturer and marketer of alloy and carbon welded oil country tubular goods
and line pipe. In 2007, U.S. Steel, a steel producer, acquired Lone Star Technologies, Inc. and named him President,
U.S. Steel Tubular Products. After joining CMC in 2010, he was named President and Chief Operating Officer in
April 2011, and in June 2011, he was appointed President and Chief Executive Officer effective September 2011. He
was appointed to our Board of Directors on September 1, 2011 and was named Chairman of the Board of Directors on
January 1, 2013.

Adam B. Batchelor joined the Company as Director of Financial Planning and Analysis in August 2011. He was
appointed Senior Director in September 2012 and Vice President of Strategy and Planning in August 2013. Prior to
joining the Company, he was with Oliver Wyman, a global management consulting firm, from 2003 to 2009, and with
Wingate Partners, a Dallas-based private equity firm, from 2009 to 2011.

Carey J. Dubois was appointed Vice President and Treasurer in January 2012. Prior to joining CMC, Mr. Dubois
served as Vice President and Treasurer for Peabody Energy Corporation, a coal mining and trading company, from
December 2010 to January 2012. From April 2005, he held the positions of Corporate Treasurer, Vice President of
Finance, and Vice President and Chief Financial Officer at Smithfield Foods, Inc., an international pork producer,
processor and marketer.

In July 2012, John Elmore joined the Company as Senior Vice President and President of CMC International Division.
Prior to joining the Company, Mr. Elmore was Group Director of Jindal Steel and Power, a leading international
company in the steel, power, mining, oil and gas and infrastructure sectors straddling across Asia, Africa, Australia,
South America and Georgia from November 2009. Previously, he was President and Chief Executive Officer of
Minnesota Steel Industries, from March 2005 to December 2007.

Terry Hatten was appointed Vice President and Chief Human Resources Officer in December 2013. Prior to joining
the Company, Mr. Hatten was Senior Vice President of Human Resources for General Nutrition Centers, Inc. (GNC),
a specialty retailer of health and wellness products, from 2012 to 2013. From 2009 to 2012, Mr. Hatten was appointed
Senior Vice President of Human Resources for Dean Foods Company, a food and beverage company.

Adam R. Hickey was appointed Vice President and Controller of the Company in April 2012. Mr. Hickey joined the
Company in February 2004 as a Senior Accountant. Since 2004, Mr. Hickey has held various positions within the
Company, including Manager of Cost & Planning, Assistant Controller and Controller of CMC Americas Division.
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Paul K. Kirkpatrick was appointed Vice President, General Counsel and Corporate Secretary in October 2013. Mr.
Kirkpatrick joined the Company in December 2009 as Assistant General Counsel and Assistant Corporate Secretary,
and in February 2013, he was appointed Vice President, Corporate Secretary and Assistant General Counsel. Prior to
joining the Company, Mr. Kirkpatrick was an attorney at Haynes and Boone, LLP, a law firm based in Dallas, Texas.
Tracy L. Porter was appointed Senior Vice President of the Company and President of CMC Americas Division in
July 2010. Mr. Porter served as Vice President of the Company and President of CMC Americas Division from April
2010 to July 2010. In the 19 years preceding July 2010, Mr. Porter has held various positions within the Company,
including General Manager of CMC
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Steel Arkansas at Magnolia, Arkansas, head of the Company's Rebar Fabrication Division, and Interim President of
CMC Americas Division.

Barbara R. Smith joined the Company in May 2011 as Senior Vice President and Chief Financial Officer. Prior to
joining the Company, Ms. Smith served as Vice President and Chief Financial Officer of Gerdau Ameristeel
Corporation, a mini-mill steel producer, since July 2007, after joining Gerdau Ameristeel as Treasurer in July 2006.
From February 2005 to July 2006, she served as Senior Vice President and Chief Financial Officer of FARO
Technologies, Inc., a developer and manufacturer of 3-D measurement and imaging systems. From 1981 to 2005, Ms.
Smith was employed by Alcoa Inc., a producer of primary aluminum, fabricated aluminum and alumina, where she
held various financial leadership positions including Vice President of Finance for Alcoa's Aerospace, Automotive &
Commercial Transportation Group, Vice President and Chief Financial Officer for Alcoa Fujikura Ltd. and Director of
Internal Audit.

ITEM 1A. RISK FACTORS

There are inherent risks and uncertainties associated with our business that could adversely affect our business, results
of operations and financial condition. Set forth below are descriptions of those risks and uncertainties that we
currently believe to be material, but the risks and uncertainties described below are not the only risks and uncertainties
that could adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition. If any of these risks actually
occurs, our business, results of operations and financial condition could be materially adversely affected.

RISKS RELATED TO OUR INDUSTRY

Our industry and the industries we serve are vulnerable to global economic conditions, including the slow recovery
from the recent recession and the risk of a recession relapse. 

Metals industries and commodity products have historically been vulnerable to significant declines in consumption,
global overcapacity and product pricing during prolonged periods of economic downturn. Our business supports
cyclical industries such as commercial, residential and government construction, energy, metals service center,
petrochemical and original equipment manufacturing. We may experience significant fluctuations in demand for our
products from these industries based on the global or regional economic conditions, energy prices, consumer demand
and decisions by governments to fund infrastructure projects such as highways, schools, energy plants and airports.
Although the residential housing market is not a significant direct factor in our business, related commercial and
infrastructure construction activities, such as shopping centers, schools and roads, could be adversely impacted by a
prolonged slump in new housing construction. Our business, results of operations and financial condition are
adversely affected when the industries we serve suffer a prolonged downturn or anemic growth. Because we do not
have unlimited backlogs, our business, results of operations and financial condition are promptly affected by
short-term economic fluctuations.

Seven years removed from the worldwide economic downturn that began in 2008, we have begun to see some
improvement in general economic and manufacturing activity, but the economic outlook remains uncertain both in the
United States and globally. In addition, uncertainties in Europe regarding the financial sector and sovereign debt and
the potential impact on banks in other regions of the world have continued to weigh on global and domestic growth.
These situations continue to contribute to weaker end-markets and depressed demand, which could stifle improving
customer confidence and adversely affect demand for our products and further adversely affect our business. Although
we believe that the long-term prospects for the steel industry remain bright, we are unable to predict the duration of
current economic conditions that are contributing to reduced demand for our products compared to pre-recession
levels. Future economic downturns or a prolonged period of slow growth or economic stagnation could materially
adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition.
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We are vulnerable to the economic conditions in the regions in which our operations are concentrated.

Our geographic concentration in the southern and southwestern United States as well as Central Europe, Australia,
China and the Middle East exposes us to the local market conditions in these regions. Economic downturns in these
areas or decisions by governments that have an impact on the level and pace of overall economic activity in one of
these regions could adversely affect demand for our products and, consequently, our sales and profitability. As a
result, our financial results are substantially dependent upon the overall economic conditions in these areas.

Rapid and significant changes in the price of metals could adversely impact our business, results of operations and
financial condition.

Prices for most metals in which we deal have experienced increased volatility over the last several years, and such
increased price
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volatility impacts us in several ways. Some of our operations, such as our fabrication operations, may benefit from
rapidly decreasing steel prices as their material cost for previously contracted fixed price work declines. Others, such
as our Americas Mills and International Mill segments, would likely experience reduced margins and may be forced
to liquidate high cost inventory at reduced margins or losses until prices stabilize. Sudden increases could have the
opposite effect. Overall, we believe that rapid substantial price changes are not to our industry's benefit. Our customer
and supplier base would be impacted due to uncertainty as to future prices. A reluctance to purchase inventory in the
face of extreme price decreases or to sell quickly during a period of rapid price increases would likely reduce our
volume of business. Marginal industry participants or speculators may attempt to participate to an unhealthy extent
during a period of rapid price escalation with a substantial risk of contract default if prices suddenly reverse. Risks of
default in contract performance by customers or suppliers as well as an increased risk of bad debts and customer credit
exposure could increase during periods of rapid and substantial price changes.

Excess capacity in our industry could increase the level of steel imports into the United States, resulting in lower
domestic prices, which would adversely affect our sales, margins and profitability.

Global steel-making capacity exceeds demand for steel products in some regions around the world. Rather than
reducing employment by rationalizing capacity with consumption, steel manufacturers in these countries (often with
local government assistance or subsidies in various forms) have traditionally periodically exported steel at prices
significantly below their home market prices, which prices may not reflect their costs of production or capital. For
example, steel production in China, the world’s largest producer and consumer of steel, has continued to exceed
Chinese demand. This rising excess capacity in China has resulted in a further increase in imports of artificially
low-priced steel and steel products to the United States and world steel markets. A continuation of this trend or a
significant decrease in China’s rate of economic expansion could result in increasing steel imports from China.
Excessive imports of steel into the United States have exerted, and may continue to exert, downward pressure on U.S.
steel prices, which negatively affects our ability to increase our sales, margins, and profitability. The excess capacity
may create downward pressure on our steel prices which would adversely affect our sales, margins and profitability
and could subject us to possible renegotiation of contracts or increases in bad debt.

We believe the downward pressure on, and periodically depressed levels of, U.S. steel prices in some recent years
have been further exacerbated by imports of steel involving dumping and subsidy abuses by foreign steel producers.
While some tariffs and quotas are periodically put into effect for certain steel products imported from a number of
countries that have been found to have been unfairly pricing steel imports to the U.S., there is no assurance that tariffs
and quotas will always be levied, even if otherwise justified, and even when imposed many of these are only
short-lived. When such tariffs or duties expire or if others are further relaxed or repealed, or if relatively higher U.S.
steel prices make it attractive for foreign steelmakers to export their steel products to the U.S., despite the presence of
duties or tariffs, the resurgence of substantial imports of foreign steel could create downward pressure on U.S. steel
prices.

Excess capacity has also led to greater protectionism as is evident in raw material and finished product border tariffs
put in place by China, Brazil and other countries. Such protectionism could have a material adverse effect on our
business, results of operations and financial condition.

Compliance with and changes in environmental compliance requirements and remediation requirements could result
in substantially increased capital requirements and operating costs; violations of environmental requirements could
result in costs that have a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and financial condition. 

Existing laws or regulations, as currently interpreted or reinterpreted in the future, and future laws and regulations,
may have a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and financial condition. Compliance with
environmental laws and regulations is a significant factor in our business. We are subject to local, state, federal and
international environmental laws and regulations concerning, among other matters, waste disposal, air emissions,
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waste and storm water effluent and disposal and employee health. Federal and state regulatory agencies can impose
administrative, civil and criminal penalties and may seek injunctive relief impacting continuing operations for
non-compliance with environmental requirements.

New facilities that we may build, especially steel minimills, like our proposed minimill in Durant, Oklahoma, are
required to obtain several environmental permits before significant construction or commencement of operations.
Delays in obtaining permits or unanticipated conditions in such permits could delay the project or increase
construction costs or operating expenses. Our manufacturing and recycling operations produce significant amounts of
by-products, some of which are handled as industrial waste or hazardous waste. For example, our minimills generate
electric arc furnace dust ("EAF dust"), which the EPA and other regulatory authorities classify as hazardous waste.
EAF dust and other industrial waste and hazardous waste require special handling, recycling or disposal.
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In addition, the primary feed materials for the shredders operated by our scrap metal recycling facilities are
automobile hulks and obsolete household appliances. Approximately 20% of the weight of an automobile hull consists
of unrecyclable material known as shredder fluff. After the segregation of ferrous and saleable nonferrous metals,
shredder fluff remains. We, along with others in the recycling industry, interpret Federal regulations to require
shredder fluff to meet certain criteria and pass a toxic leaching test to avoid classification as a hazardous waste. We
also endeavor to remove hazardous contaminants from the feed material prior to shredding. As a result, we believe the
shredder fluff we generate is not normally considered or properly classified as hazardous waste. If the laws,
regulations or testing methods change with regard to EAF dust or shredder fluff or other by-products, we may incur
additional significant costs.

Changes to National Ambient Air Quality Standards ("NAAQS") or other requirements on our air emissions could
make it more difficult to obtain new permits or to modify existing permits and could require changes to our operations
or emissions control equipment. Such difficulties and changes could result in operational delays and capital and
on-going compliance expenditures.

Legal requirements are changing frequently and are subject to interpretation. New laws, regulations and changing
interpretations by regulatory authorities, together with uncertainty regarding adequate pollution control levels, testing
and sampling procedures, new pollution control technology and cost/benefit analysis based on market conditions are
all factors that may increase our future expenditures to comply with environmental requirements. Accordingly, we are
unable to predict the ultimate cost of future compliance with these requirements or their effect on our operations. We
cannot predict whether such costs would be able to be passed on to customers through product price increases.
Competitors in various regions or countries where environmental regulation is less restrictive, subject to different
interpretation or generally not enforced, may enjoy a competitive advantage.

We may also be required to conduct additional cleanup (and pay for associated natural resource damages) at sites
where we have already participated in remediation efforts or to take remediation action with regard to sites formerly
used in connection with our operations. We may be required to pay for a portion or all of the costs of cleanup or
remediation at sites we never owned or on which we never operated if we are found to have arranged for treatment or
disposal of hazardous substances on the sites. In cases of joint and several liability, we may be obligated to pay a
disproportionate share of cleanup costs if other responsible parties are financially insolvent.

We are involved and may in the future become involved in various environmental matters that may result in fines,
penalties or judgments being assessed against us or liability imposed upon us which we cannot presently estimate or
reasonably foresee and which may have a material impact on our business, results of operations and financial
condition.

Under CERCLA or similar state statutes, we may have obligations to conduct investigation and remediation activities
associated with alleged releases of hazardous substances or to reimburse the EPA (or state agencies as applicable) for
such activities and to pay for natural resource damages associated with alleged releases. We have been named a PRP
at several federal and state Superfund sites because the EPA or an equivalent state agency contends that we and other
potentially responsible scrap metal suppliers are liable for the cleanup of those sites as a result of having sold scrap
metal to unrelated manufacturers for recycling as a raw material in the manufacture of new products. We are involved
in litigation or administrative proceedings with regard to several of these sites in which we are contesting, or at the
appropriate time may contest, our liability. In addition, we have received information requests with regard to other
sites which may be under consideration by the EPA as potential CERCLA sites.

We are presently participating in PRP organizations at several sites, which are paying for certain remediation
expenses. Although we are unable to estimate precisely the ultimate dollar amount of exposure to loss in connection
with various environmental matters or the effect on our consolidated financial position, we make accruals as
warranted. In addition, although we do not believe that a reasonably possible range of loss in excess of amounts
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accrued for pending lawsuits, claims or proceedings would be material to our financial statements, additional
developments may occur, and due to inherent uncertainties, including evolving remediation technology, changing
regulations, possible third-party contributions, the inherent shortcomings of the estimation process, the uncertainties
involved in litigation and other factors, the amounts we ultimately are required to pay could vary significantly from
the amounts we accrue, and this could have a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and
financial condition.

Increased regulation associated with climate change and greenhouse gas emissions could impose significant additional
costs on both our steelmaking and metals recycling operations.

The U.S. government and various governmental agencies have introduced or are contemplating regulatory changes in
response to the potential impact of climate change. International treaties or agreements may also result in increasing
regulation of greenhouse gas emissions, including the introduction of carbon emissions trading mechanisms. Any such
regulation regarding climate change and greenhouse gas ("GHG") emissions could impose significant costs on our
steelmaking and metals recycling operations and on the operations of our customers and suppliers, including increased
energy, capital equipment, environmental monitoring and reporting and other costs in order to comply with current or
future laws or regulations concerning and limitations imposed on our
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operations by virtue of climate change and GHG emissions laws and regulations. The potential costs of "allowances,"
"offsets" or "credits" that may be part of potential cap-and-trade programs or similar future regulatory measures are
still uncertain. Any adopted future climate change and GHG regulations could negatively impact our ability (and that
of our customers and suppliers) to compete with companies situated in areas not subject to such limitations. From a
medium and long-term perspective, as a result of these regulatory initiatives, we may see an increase in costs relating
to our assets that emit significant amounts of greenhouse gases. These regulatory initiatives will be either voluntary or
mandatory and may impact our operations directly or through our suppliers or customers. Until the timing, scope and
extent of any future regulation becomes known, we cannot predict the effect on our business, results of operations or
financial condition, but such effect could be materially adverse to our business, results of operations and financial
condition.

RISKS RELATED TO OUR COMPANY

Potential limitations on our ability to access credit, or the ability of our customers and suppliers to access credit, may
adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition.

If our access to credit is limited or impaired, our business, results of operations and financial condition could be
adversely impacted. Our senior unsecured debt is rated by Standard & Poor's Corporation and Moody's Investors
Service. In determining our credit ratings, the rating agencies consider a number of both quantitative and qualitative
factors. These factors include earnings (loss), fixed charges such as interest, cash flows, total debt outstanding,
off-balance sheet obligations and other commitments, total capitalization and various ratios calculated from these
factors. The rating agencies also consider predictability of cash flows, business strategy and diversity, industry
conditions and contingencies. Any downgrades in our credit ratings may make raising capital more difficult, increase
the cost and affect the terms of future borrowings, affect the terms under which we purchase goods and services and
limit our ability to take advantage of potential business opportunities. We could also be adversely affected if our banks
refused to honor their contractual commitments or ceased lending.

We are also exposed to risks associated with the creditworthiness of our customers and suppliers. In certain markets,
we have experienced a consolidation among those entities to whom we sell. This consolidation has resulted in an
increased credit risk spread among fewer customers, often without a corresponding strengthening of their financial
status. If the availability of credit to fund or support the continuation and expansion of our customers' business
operations is curtailed or if the cost of that credit is increased, the resulting inability of our customers or of their
customers to either access credit or absorb the increased cost of that credit could adversely affect our business by
reducing our sales or by increasing our exposure to losses from uncollectible customer accounts. The consequences of
such adverse effects could include the interruption of production at the facilities of our customers, the reduction, delay
or cancellation of customer orders, delays or interruptions of the supply of raw materials we purchase, and bankruptcy
of customers, suppliers or other creditors. Any of these events may adversely affect our business, results of operations
and financial condition.

The potential impact of our customers' non-compliance with existing commercial contracts and commitments, due to
insolvency or for any other reason, may adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition.
Most consumers of the metals products we sell have been negatively impacted by the recession and the continued
slow recovery therefrom. Due to their economic hardship or the contraction in their operations or due to the fact that
the prices for many of the products we sell have declined since the customers entered into the contracts with us, some
of our customers have sought to renegotiate or cancel their existing purchase commitments. In addition, some of our
customers have breached previously agreed upon contracts to buy our products by refusing delivery of the products.

Where appropriate, we have and will in the future pursue litigation to recover our damages resulting from customer
contract defaults. We also use credit insurance both in the United States and internationally to mitigate the risk of
customer insolvency. However, it is possible that we may not be capable of recovering all of our insured losses if the
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insurers with whom our accounts receivable are insured experience significant losses threatening their viability.
Additionally, credit insurance policies typically have relatively short policy periods and require pre-approval of
customers with maximum insured limits established by the customer. If credit insurers incur large losses, the
insurance may be more difficult and more costly to secure and may be on less favorable terms. In addition, a
significant amount of our accounts receivable are considered to be open account uninsured accounts receivable. A
large number of our customers defaulting on existing contractual obligations to purchase our products could have a
material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and financial condition.

There can be no assurance that we will repurchase shares of our common stock at all or in any particular amounts.
On October 28, 2014, we announced that our Board of Directors had authorized the Company to repurchase up to
$100.0 million of shares of our common stock. The stock markets in general have experienced substantial price and
trading fluctuations, which
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have resulted in volatility in the market prices of securities that often are unrelated or disproportionate to changes in
operating performance. These broad market fluctuations may adversely affect the trading price of our common stock.
Price volatility over a given period may also cause the average price at which we repurchase our own common stock
to exceed the stock's price at a given point in time. In addition, significant changes in the trading price of our common
stock and our ability to access capital on terms favorable to us could impact our ability to repurchase shares of our
common stock. The timing and amount of any repurchases will be determined by the Company's management based
on its evaluation of market conditions, capital allocation alternatives and other factors beyond our control. Our share
repurchase program may be modified, suspended, extended or terminated by the Company at any time and without
notice. Any failure to repurchase stock after we have announced our intention to do so may negatively impact investor
confidence in us, thereby negatively impacting our stock price.

The agreements governing our notes and our other debt contain financial covenants and impose restrictions on our
business.

The indenture governing our 6.50% notes due 2017, 7.35% notes due 2018 and 4.875% notes due 2023 contains
restrictions on our ability to create liens, sell assets, enter into sale and leaseback transactions and consolidate or
merge. In addition to these restrictions, our credit facility contains covenants that restrict our ability to, among other
things, enter into transactions with affiliates and guarantee the debt of some of our subsidiaries. Our credit facility also
requires that we meet certain financial tests and maintain certain financial ratios, including a maximum debt to
capitalization and interest coverage ratios.

Other agreements that we may enter into in the future may contain covenants imposing significant restrictions on our
business that are similar to, or in addition to, the covenants under our existing agreements. These restrictions may
affect our ability to operate our business and may limit our ability to take advantage of potential business
opportunities as they arise.

Our ability to comply with these covenants may be affected by events beyond our control, including prevailing
economic, financial and industry conditions. The breach of any of these covenants could result in a default under the
indenture governing the notes or under our other debt agreements. An event of default under our debt agreements
would permit some of our lenders to declare all amounts borrowed from them to be due and payable, together with
accrued and unpaid interest. If we were unable to repay debt to our secured lenders or if we incur secured debt in the
future, these lenders could proceed against the collateral securing that debt. In addition, acceleration of our other
indebtedness may cause us to be unable to make interest payments on the notes.

Increases in the value of the U.S. dollar relative to other currencies may adversely affect our business, results of
operations and financial condition.

An increase in the value of the U.S. dollar may adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial
condition, and in particular, the increased strength of the U.S. dollar as compared to China's renminbi or the euro
could adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition. A strong U.S. dollar makes imported
metal products less expensive, resulting in more imports of steel products into the United States by our foreign
competitors, while a weak U.S. dollar may have the opposite impact on imports. With the exception of exports of
nonferrous scrap metal by our Americas Recycling segment, we have not recently been a significant exporter of metal
products from our United States operations. Economic difficulties in some large steel-producing regions of the world,
resulting in lower local demand for steel products, have historically encouraged greater steel exports to the United
States at depressed prices which can be exacerbated by a strong dollar. As a result, our products that are made in the
United States may become relatively more expensive as compared to imported steel, which has had and in the future
could have a negative impact on our business, results of operations and financial condition.
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A strong U.S. dollar may also hamper our international marketing and distribution business. Weak local currencies
limit the amount of U.S. dollar denominated products that we can import for our international operations and limit our
ability to be competitive against local producers selling in local currencies.

The U.S. dollar, as with most global currencies, are subject to daily price volatility based on several factors including
changes in local government interest rates, macro events and developments, currency manipulation by governments in
countries where they buy or sell foreign currencies to strengthen or weaken the local currency or in those instances
where local governments fix the pricing of their currencies versus having floating exchange rates.
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Operating internationally carries risks and uncertainties which could adversely affect our business, results of
operations and financial condition.

Our foreign operations generated approximately 22% of our fiscal 2015 net sales. We have significant facilities in
Poland and Australia. Our marketing and trading offices are located in most major markets of the world, and our
suppliers and customers are located throughout the world. Our marketing and distribution segment relies on
substantial international shipments of materials and products in the ordinary course of its business. Our stability,
growth and profitability are subject to a number of risks inherent in doing business internationally in addition to the
currency exchange risk discussed above, including:

•political, military, terrorist or major pandemic events;

•local labor and social issues;

•
legal and regulatory requirements or limitations imposed by foreign governments (particularly those with significant
steel consumption or steel related production including China, Brazil, Russia and India), including quotas, tariffs or
other protectionist trade barriers, adverse tax law changes, nationalization or currency restrictions;

•disruptions or delays in shipments caused by customs compliance or government agencies; and

•potential difficulties in staffing and managing local operations.

These factors may adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition.

We rely on the availability of large amounts of electricity and natural gas for our minimill operations. Disruptions in
delivery or substantial increases in energy costs, including crude oil prices, could adversely affect our business, results
of operations and financial condition.

Minimills melt steel scrap in electric arc furnaces and use natural gas to heat steel billets for rolling into finished
products. As large consumers of electricity and gas, often the largest in the geographic area where our minimills are
located, we must have dependable delivery of electricity and natural gas in order to operate. Accordingly, we are at
risk in the event of an energy disruption. Prolonged black-outs or brown-outs or disruptions caused by natural
disasters such as hurricanes would substantially disrupt our production. While we have not suffered prolonged
production delays due to our inability to access electricity or natural gas, several of our competitors have experienced
such occurrences. Prolonged substantial increases in energy costs would have an adverse effect on the costs of
operating our minimills and would negatively impact our gross margins unless we were able to fully pass through the
additional expense to our customers. Our finished steel products are typically delivered by truck. Rapid increases in
the price of fuel attributable to increases in crude oil prices would increase our costs and adversely affect many of our
customers' financial results, which in turn could result in reduced margins and declining demand for our products.
Rapid increases in fuel costs may also negatively impact our ability to charter ships for international deliveries at
anticipated freight rates, thereby decreasing our margins on those transactions or causing our customers to look for
alternative sources.

The loss of or inability to hire key employees may adversely affect our ability to successfully manage our operations
and meet our strategic objectives. 

Our future success depends, in large part, on the continued service of our officers and other key employees and our
ability to continue to attract and retain additional highly qualified personnel. These employees are integral to our
success based on their expertise and knowledge of our business and products. We compete for such personnel with
other companies, including public and private company competitors who may periodically offer more favorable terms
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of employment. The loss or interruption of the services of a number of our key employees could reduce our ability to
effectively manage our operations due to the fact that we may not be able to find appropriate replacement personnel in
a timely manner should the need arise.
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We may have difficulty competing with companies that have a lower cost structure or access to greater financial
resources.

We compete with regional, national and foreign manufacturers and traders. Consolidation among participants in the
steel manufacturing and recycling industries has resulted in fewer competitors but several of which are significantly
larger than us. Some of our larger competitors have greater financial resources and more diverse businesses than us.
Some of our foreign competitors may be able to pursue business opportunities without regard to certain of the laws
and regulations with which we must comply, such as environmental regulations. These companies may have a lower
cost structure and more operating flexibility, and consequently they may be able to offer better prices and more
services than we can. There is no assurance that we will be able to compete successfully with these companies. Any of
these factors could have a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and financial condition.

Information technology interruptions and breaches in data security could adversely impact our business, results of
operations and financial condition.

We rely on computers, information and communications technology and related systems and networks in order to
operate our business, including to store sensitive data such as intellectual property, our own proprietary business
information and that of our customers, suppliers and business partners and personally identifiable information of our
employees. Increased global information technology security requirements, vulnerabilities, threats and a rise in
sophisticated and targeted computer crime pose a risk to the security of our systems, networks and the confidentiality,
availability and integrity of our data. Our systems and networks are also subject to damage or interruption from power
outages, telecommunications failures, employee error and other similar events. Any of these or other events could
result in system interruption, the disclosure, modification or destruction of proprietary and other key information,
legal claims or proceedings, production delays or disruptions to operations including processing transactions and
reporting financial results and could adversely impact our reputation and our operating results. We have taken steps to
address these concerns and have implemented internal control and security measures to protect our systems and
networks from security breaches; however, there can be no assurance that a system or network failure, or security
breach, will not impact our business, results of operations and financial condition.

Our minimills require continuous capital investments that we may not be able to sustain.

We must make regular substantial capital investments in our steel minimills to maintain the minimills, lower
production costs and remain competitive. We cannot be certain that we will have sufficient internally generated cash
or acceptable external financing to make necessary substantial capital expenditures in the future. The availability of
external financing depends on many factors outside of our control, including capital market conditions and the overall
performance of the economy. If funding is insufficient, we may be unable to develop or enhance our minimills, take
advantage of business opportunities and respond to competitive pressures.

Scrap and other supplies for our business are subject to significant price fluctuations and limited availability, which
may adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition. 

At any given time, we may be unable to obtain an adequate supply of critical raw materials with a price and other
terms acceptable to us. We depend on ferrous scrap, the primary feedstock for our steel minimills, and other supplies
such as graphite electrodes and ferroalloys for our steel minimill operations. The price of scrap and other supplies has
historically been subject to significant fluctuation, and we may not be able to adjust our product prices to recover the
costs of rapid increases in material prices, especially over the short-term and in our domestic fabrication segment's
fixed price contracts. The profitability of our steel minimill operations and domestic fabrication segments would be
adversely affected if we are unable to pass on to our customers increased raw material and supply costs. Changing
process could potentially impact the volume of scrap metal available to us and the volume and realized margins of
processed metal we sell.
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The purchase prices for automobile bodies and various other grades of obsolete and industrial scrap, as well as the
selling prices for processed and recycled scrap metals we utilize in our own manufacturing process or we resell to
others, are highly volatile. A prolonged period of low scrap prices or a fall in scrap prices could reduce our ability to
obtain, process and sell recycled material, which could have a material adverse effect on our metals recycling
operations business, results of operations and financial condition. Our ability to respond to changing recycled metal
selling prices may be limited by competitive or other factors during periods of low scrap prices, when the supply of
scrap may decline considerably, as scrap generators hold onto their scrap in the hope of getting higher prices later;
conversely, increased foreign demand for scrap due to economic expansion in countries such as China, India, Brazil
and Turkey can result in an outflow of available domestic scrap as well as higher scrap prices that cannot always be
passed on to domestic scrap consumers, further reducing the available domestic scrap flows and scrap margins all of
which could adversely affect our sales and profitability.
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Our Arkansas mill does not have melting capacity, so it is dependent on an adequate supply of competitively priced
used rail. The availability of used rail fluctuates with the pace of railroad abandonments, rail replacement by railroads
in the United States and abroad and demand for used rail from other domestic and foreign rail rerolling mills. Price
increases for used rail could adversely affect our business, results of operations and financial condition.

The availability and process of raw materials may also be negatively affected by new laws and regulations, allocations
by suppliers, interruptions in production, accidents or natural disasters, changes in exchange rates, worldwide price
fluctuations, and the availability and cost of transportation. If we were unable to obtain adequate and timely deliveries
of our required raw materials, we may be unable to timely manufacture significant quantities of our products.

Unexpected equipment failures may lead to production curtailments or shutdowns, which may adversely affect our
business, results of operations and financial condition.

Interruptions in our production capabilities would adversely affect our production costs, steel available for sale and
earnings for the affected period. Our manufacturing processes are dependent upon critical pieces of steel-making
equipment, such as our furnaces, continuous casters and rolling equipment, as well as electrical equipment, such as
transformers. This equipment may, on occasion, be out of service as a result of unanticipated failures. We have
experienced, and may in the future experience, material plant shutdowns or periods of reduced production as a result
of such equipment failures. In addition to equipment failures, our facilities are also subject to the risk of catastrophic
loss due to unanticipated events such as fires, explosions or violent weather conditions.

Competition from other materials may have a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and
financial condition.

In many applications, steel competes with other materials, such as aluminum and plastics (particularly in the
automobile industry), cement, composites, glass and wood. Increased use of or additional substitutes for steel products
could adversely affect future market prices and demand for steel products.

Hedging transactions may expose us to losses or limit our potential gains.

Our product lines and worldwide operations expose us to risks associated with fluctuations in foreign currency
exchange rates, commodity prices and interest rates. As part of our risk management program, we use financial
instruments, including metals commodity futures, natural gas forward contracts, freight forward contracts, foreign
currency exchange forward contracts and interest rate swap contracts. While intended to reduce the effects of the
fluctuations, these transactions may limit our potential gains or expose us to losses. If our counterparties to such
transactions or the sponsors of the exchanges through which these transactions are offered, such as the London Metal
Exchange, fail to honor their obligations due to financial distress, we would be exposed to potential losses or the
inability to recover anticipated gains from these transactions.

We enter into the foreign currency exchange forward contracts as economic hedges of trade commitments or
anticipated commitments denominated in currencies other than the functional currency to mitigate the effects of
changes in currency rates. These foreign exchange commitments are dependent on timely performance by our
counterparties. Their failure to perform could result in our having to close these hedges without the anticipated
underlying transaction and could result in losses if foreign currency exchange rates have changed.
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We are subject to litigation and legal compliance risks which could adversely affect our business, results of operations
and financial condition.

We are involved in various litigation matters, including regulatory proceedings, administrative proceedings,
governmental investigations, environmental matters and construction contract disputes. The nature of our operations
also exposes us to possible litigation claims in the future. Because of the uncertain nature of litigation and coverage
decisions, we cannot predict the outcome of these matters. These matters could have a material adverse effect on our
business, results of operations and financial condition. Litigation is very costly, and the costs associated with
prosecuting and defending litigation matters could have a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations
and financial condition. Although we are unable to estimate precisely the ultimate dollar amount of exposure to loss in
connection with litigation matters, we make accruals as warranted. However, the amounts that we accrue could vary
significantly from the amounts we actually pay, due to inherent uncertainties and the inherent shortcomings of the
estimation process, the uncertainties involved in litigation and other factors. See Part I, Item 3, Legal Proceedings, for
a description of our current significant legal proceedings.

As noted above, existing laws or regulations, as currently interpreted or reinterpreted in the future, and future laws and
regulations, may have a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and financial condition. See
“Compliance with and changes in environmental compliance requirements and remediation requirements could result
in substantially increased capital requirements and operating costs; violations of environmental requirements could
result in costs that have a material adverse effect on our financial condition” above for a description of such risks
relating to environmental laws and regulations. In addition to such environmental laws and regulations, complex
foreign and U.S. laws and regulations that apply to our international operations, including without limitation the
Foreign Corrupt Practices Act and similar laws in other countries, which generally prohibit companies and those
acting on their behalf from making improper payments to foreign government officials for the purpose of obtaining or
retaining business, regulations related to import-export controls, the Office of Foreign Assets Control sanctions
program and antiboycott provisions, may increase our cost of doing business in international jurisdictions and expose
us and our employees to elevated risk. While we believe that we have adopted appropriate risk management and
compliance programs, the nature of our operations means that legal and compliance risks will continue to exist. A
negative outcome in an unusual or significant legal proceeding or compliance investigation could adversely affect our
business, results of operations and financial condition.

Some of our operations present significant risk of injury or death.

The industrial activities conducted at our facilities present significant risk of serious injury or death to our employees,
customers or other visitors to our operations, notwithstanding our safety precautions, including our material
compliance with Federal, state and local employee health and safety regulations, and we may be unable to avoid
material liabilities for injuries or deaths. We maintain workers' compensation insurance to address the risk of incurring
material liabilities for injuries or deaths, but there can be no assurance that the insurance coverage will be adequate or
will continue to be available on the terms acceptable to us, or at all, which could result in material liabilities to us for
any injuries or deaths.

Health care legislation could result in substantially increased costs and adversely affect our workforce.

Recently enacted health care mandates may cause us to evaluate the scope of health benefits offered to our workforce
and the method in which they are delivered, and increase our and our employees' costs. If we are not able to offer a
competitive level of benefits, our ability to hire and retain qualified personnel may be adversely affected. Higher
health care costs may result in (i) an inability to reinvest sufficient capital in our operations, (ii) an inability to sustain
dividends, (iii) lowered debt ratings and (iv) an increase in the cost of capital, all of which may have a negative effect
on the price of our common stock and a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations and financial
condition.
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ITEM 1B. UNRESOLVED STAFF COMMENTS

None.

ITEM 2. PROPERTIES

Americas Mills 
Our Alabama steel minimill is located on approximately 70 acres of land, and it includes several buildings that occupy
approximately 600,000 square feet. Our Arizona steel minimill is located on approximately 230 acres of land, and the
buildings occupy approximately 320,000 square feet. Our Arkansas steel minimill is located on approximately 120
acres of land, and the buildings occupy approximately 240,000 square feet. Our South Carolina steel minimill is
located on approximately 140 acres of land, and
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the buildings occupy approximately 760,000 square feet. Our Texas steel minimill is located on approximately 660
acres of land, and its facilities include several buildings that occupy approximately 870,000 square feet.

Americas Recycling
Our U.S. scrap metal processing facilities occupy approximately 740 acres of land, approximately 40 acres of which
we lease.

Americas Fabrication 
We conduct steel fabrication at 42 locations, which occupy approximately 420 acres of land, approximately 10 acres
of which we lease. Additionally, we conduct our construction services in 24 locations, which occupy approximately
80 acres of land, approximately 50 acres of which we lease. Finally, CMC Impact Metals occupies two locations
covering approximately 110 acres of land that we own.

International Mill 
CMCP's steel manufacturing operations are located in Zawiercie in South Central Poland about 40 kilometers from
Katowice. CMCP and its subsidiaries lease approximately 98% of the 2 million square meters of land utilized for its
principal operations with the remaining portion owned. The land is leased from the State of Poland under contracts
with 99 year terms that are considered to create a right of perpetual usufruct. The leases expire beginning in 2089
through 2100. The principal operations are conducted in buildings having an area of approximately 260,000 square
meters. The real estate is also developed with over 130 other buildings, including warehouses, administrative offices,
workshops, a garage, transformer stations, pumping stations, gas stations, boiler houses, gate houses and certain
structures leased to unrelated parties and CMCP subsidiaries. Other much smaller tracts of land are leased or owned,
including those utilized by scrap processing facilities and downstream fabrication shops across Poland. Our
international fabrication operations utilize approximately 136,000 square meters of land, which is either owned or
subject to a perpetual usufruct.

International Marketing and Distribution 
We own one warehouse building utilized by our operations in Australia which is located on leased real estate. We
lease one warehouse facility located in Australia as well as our Australian headquarters, marketing and administration
offices. We lease one warehouse facility near Houston, Texas which handles and stores material for one of our
marketing and distribution divisions headquartered in the U.S. Our UK distribution operation leases a warehouse
building for inventory storage as well as sales and administrative offices. The remaining trading offices operate out of
leased spaces. Additionally, this segment operates a recycling facility in Singapore, which is located on approximately
two acres of leased land.

Corporate 
We lease the office space occupied by our corporate headquarters.

The leases on the leased properties described above will expire on various dates and, with the exception of the CMCP
leases described above, generally expire over the next ten years. Several of the leases have renewal options. We have
had little difficulty in the past renewing such leases prior to their expiration. We estimate our minimum annual rental
obligation for real estate operating leases in effect at August 31, 2015, to be paid during fiscal 2016, to be
approximately $14.0 million.

ITEM 3. LEGAL PROCEEDINGS

In the ordinary course of conducting our business, we become involved in litigation, administrative proceedings and
government investigations, including environmental matters.
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In the third quarter of fiscal 2015, the Company recorded a $45.5 million benefit as a result of a termination of a
contract with a customer and is included in net sales on the Company's consolidated statements of earnings for fiscal
2015.

We have received notices from the EPA or state agencies with similar responsibility that we and numerous other
parties are considered PRPs and may be obligated under CERCLA, or similar state statutes, to pay for the cost of
remedial investigation, feasibility studies and ultimately remediation to correct alleged releases of hazardous
substances at ten locations. The notices refer to the following locations, none of which involve real estate we ever
owned or upon which we ever conducted operations: the Sapp Battery Site in Cottondale, Florida, the Interstate Lead
Company Site in Leeds, Alabama, the Ross Metals Site in Rossville, Tennessee, the Li Tungsten Site in Glen Cove,
New York, the Peak Oil Site in Tampa, Florida, the R&H Oil Site in San Antonio, Texas, the SoGreen/Parramore Site
in Tifton, Georgia, the Jensen Drive site in Houston, Texas, and the Industrial Salvage site in Corpus Christi, Texas.
We may contest our designation as a PRP with regard to certain sites, while at other sites we are participating
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with other named PRPs in agreements or negotiations that have resulted or that we expect will result in agreements to
remediate the sites. During 2010, we acquired a 70% interest in the real property at Jensen Drive as part of the
remediation of that site. We have periodically received information requests from government environmental agencies
with regard to other sites that are apparently under consideration for designation as listed sites under CERCLA or
similar state statutes. Often we do not receive any further communication with regard to these sites, and as of the date
of this Annual Report on Form 10-K, we do not know if any of these inquiries will ultimately result in a demand for
payment from us.

The EPA notified us and other alleged PRPs that under Section 106 of CERCLA, we and the other PRPs could be
subject to a maximum fine of $25,000 per day and the imposition of treble damages if we and the other PRPs refuse to
clean up the Peak Oil, Sapp Battery and SoGreen/Parramore sites as ordered by the EPA. We are presently
participating in PRP organizations at these sites, which are paying for certain site remediation expenses. We do not
believe that the EPA will pursue any fines against us if we continue to participate in the PRP groups or if we have
adequate defenses to the EPA's imposition of fines against us in these matters.

We believe that adequate provisions have been made in the financial statements for the potential impact of any loss in
connection with the above-described legal proceedings and environmental matters. Management believes that the
outcome of the proceedings mentioned, and other miscellaneous litigation and proceedings now pending, will not have
a material adverse effect on our business, results of operations or financial condition.

ITEM 4. MINE SAFETY DISCLOSURE

Not applicable.
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PART II

ITEM 5. MARKET FOR REGISTRANT'S COMMON EQUITY, RELATED STOCKHOLDER MATTERS AND
ISSUER PURCHASES OF EQUITY SECURITIES

MARKET AND DIVIDEND INFORMATION

The table below summarizes the high and low sales prices reported on the New York Stock Exchange (the "NYSE")
for a share of CMC common stock and the quarterly cash dividends per share that CMC paid for the past two fiscal
years.

PRICE RANGE
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